
The LifeClass hotels are home to calm, clean and well-mannered dogs who are used
to the company of humans and other dogs. They are welcome with their owners at
Hotel Slovenija, Grand Hotel Portorož, Hotel Apollo and Hotel Mirna at an extra cost.

To ensure a pleasant stay for everyone, we have prepared a four-paw holiday guide
for you and your furry companions.

Entrance to the hotel beach: the hotel beach is exclusively for you, dear guests. To
make it comfortable for everyone, please allow your four-legged friend to have fun
on the beaches reserved for dogs. You can check the list of beaches on the QR
code.

Terme Portorož: The thermal areas are designed for your relaxation, so your four-
legged friends will have to wait in your room. Their relaxation awaits them on the
nearby walking paths and lawns.

Patisserie, restaurants and bars: our patisserie, bars and most of the hotel's
restaurants are places where we create experiences that are exclusively for you.      
We have prepared a special feature for the guest of Hotel Mirna: in front of the
Hotel Mirna restaurant, there is a special corner where you can enjoy your breakfast
together with your four-lrgged friend in a quiet and safe place.

Clean room, happy guests: we want to keep your room fresh and clean. Please
make sure your dog is with you at the time of cleaning, as our team doesn't know
them that well. You can arrange a scheduled the cleaning time at the reception.

You are responsible for the actions of your four-legged friends, including any
compensation and costs incurred in the event of damage to property. Please contact
the hotel reception for further information.

Four-legged guests must never be left unattended. If this does happen, please inform
the hotel reception and leave a telephone number for the receptionist to call you if
necessary. If you hire a person to look after your pet in your absence, you must
inform the hotel reception.

Scan the QR code for
more information
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